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20.0. STANDBY SERVICE RIDER 
 
20.1. REGULATORY AUTHORITY 
 

The Arkansas Legislature has delegated authority to the Arkansas Public Service 
Commission (“APSC” or the “Commission”) to regulate public utilities in the State of 
Arkansas, including Entergy Arkansas, LLC (“EAL” or the “Company”).  The APSC’s 
regulatory authority over the provision of electric service applies not only in the 
Distribution Service area allocated to EAL by the APSC but also extends to service to 
customers who have been released to EAL by other electric distribution utilities, when 
such release for service has been approved by the Commission pursuant to Rule 6.07(b) 
or (c) of the Commission's Rules of Practice and Procedure.  Similarly, the Tennessee 
Regulatory Authority exercises such authority delegated to it by the Tennessee 
legislature in areas of the State of Tennessee served by EAL. 

 
20.2. AVAILABILITY 
 

This schedule is applicable to customers who have their own generating equipment and 
who contract for Standby Service from the Company. Standby Service is composed of 
Reserved Service, Maintenance Service, Backup Service, and Non-Reserved Service as 
defined below. The Company is not obligated to provide Maintenance or Backup Service 
in excess of a customer’s Reserved Service. 

 
Standby Service shall be restricted to a total number of kW, which number shall not 
exceed the nameplate rating of the customer’s generating equipment which may be 
operated in parallel with the Company’s system. 

 
The customer shall not resell or share any power purchased under this schedule, except 
in cases of Qualified Facilities (QF) sales, resale and sharing among facilities treated as 
a single QF under PURPA as interpreted by the Federal Energy Regulatory Commission 
and applicable case law. 

 
Service under this Rider is available only under the Agreement for Electric Service 
contained in Policy Schedule No. 13, Contract Forms. 

 
20.3. CHARACTER OF SERVICE 
 

Single- or three-phase, 60 cycles and at one standard delivery voltage required by 
customer and available at customer’s service location where service is delivered and 
metered at voltages less than 13,800Y/7,960.  For service delivered and/or metered at 
other voltages, see Rate Schedule No. 18 for the appropriate adjustments to the Net 
Monthly Rate. 

 



ARKANSAS PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION  
   
Original Sheet No. 20.2 Schedule Sheet 2 of 11  
   
Replacing:   Sheet No.    
   
Entergy Arkansas, LLC   
Name of Company   
   
Kind of Service: Electric Class of Service: Commercial/Industrial Docket No.:  18-073-TF 
  Order No.:    2 
Part III. Rate Schedule No. 20  Effective:      2/1/19 
   
Title: Standby Service Rider (SSR)  PSC File Mark Only 

 

THIS SPACE FOR PSC USE ONLY 

 

20.4. MODIFICATION OF REGULAR RATE SCHEDULE 
 

Service taken under this schedule may be in addition to other service provided by the 
Company. Service necessary to supply the customer’s other load requirements shall be 
billed on the applicable rate schedule(s) of the Company, and the other rate schedules in 
such case, if applicable, will be modified by the application of § 20.5 and § 20.7 of this 
Schedule. 

 
20.5. TYPES OF SERVICE AND BILLING DETERMINANTS  
 
20.5.1. Reserved Service 
 

Reserved Service is the electric energy and capacity the Company stands ready to 
supply during a scheduled or unscheduled outage of the customer’s on-site generation 
equipment. The Reserved Service Billing Demand in a month shall be equal to the 
greater of: (1) the amount of Contracted kW, (2) the maximum Daily Maintenance Service 
Billing Demand established during the term of service of the contract, (3) the maximum 
Daily Backup Service Billing Demand established during the term of service of the 
contract, or (4) the maximum Reserved Service Billing Demand established during the 
prior contract with the customer, unless it was established from use of Contracted kW, 
unless customer has changed the rated capacity of its self-generation unit or unless 
customer has provided verifiable evidence of a non-temporary change in operation that 
results in reduced self-generation consumption needs.   Should the customer’s demand 
during a Maintenance period be established such that Backup Service is supplied in 
addition to the requested Maintenance Service, the sum of such Backup Service and the 
requested Maintenance Service shall establish the customer’s Reserved Service Billing 
Demand. 

 
20.5.2. Maintenance Service 
 

Maintenance Service is electric energy and capacity supplied by the Company during a 
scheduled outage of the customer’s generating equipment. Maintenance Service will be 
available during the service months of October through May, and during the off-peak 
hours (as defined in § 20.8) of the service months of June through September. During the 
service months of June through September, Maintenance Service will not be scheduled 
for a continuous period of less than one day.  Customers must notify the Company no 
less than seven (7) days in advance of the intent to take Maintenance Service. 
Arrangements for and scheduling of Maintenance Service (the “Maintenance Period”) will 
be agreed in writing in advance of use, or confirmed in writing if arranged verbally. 
Maintenance Service will be scheduled only during such times, in such manner and at 
such locations that, in the Company’s reasonably exercised opinion, will not result in 
affecting adversely or jeopardizing firm service to other customers, prior commitments for 
Maintenance Service to other customers, or commitments to other utilities.   
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The Company is not obligated to furnish Maintenance Service in excess of that which is 
scheduled by the customer.  If customer takes service in excess of the scheduled 
Maintenance Service and such excess has not been approved pursuant to a request for 
Non-Reserved Service, such excess shall be treated as Backup Service.  Where there 
are applications from more than one customer, or applications are for more capacity than 
Company has available, Company shall schedule available service on a first come, first 
accepted basis. 

 
The Daily Maintenance Service Billing Demand for each calendar day of the Maintenance 
Period shall be the lesser of (1) the maximum measured 15-minute demand established 
during such day less, in the case where a customer purchases power from the Company 
under other rate schedule(s), contract power as established under such other rate 
schedule(s) or (2) the scheduled maintenance kW.  During a Maintenance Period for 
which Non-Reserved Service has been approved, the customer may schedule only his 
Reserved Service Billing Demand as the maintenance kW.  In no event shall the Daily 
Maintenance Service Billing Demand be less than zero.  Measurement of the customer’s 
maximum 15-minute demand is subject to relevant metering practices, power factor 
adjustments, and other provisions described herein. 

 
Notwithstanding the above, where Maintenance Service stands requested, agreed and 
scheduled, but not taken, the Daily Maintenance Service Billing Demand will be the 
scheduled maintenance kW under the following conditions: (a) the Company has refused 
to supply some other customer similar service in order to limit total Maintenance Service 
to that which the Company considers available or, (b) if in anticipation of providing such 
Maintenance Service the Company has incurred costs that would not otherwise have 
been incurred. The Company shall undertake all reasonable efforts in order to avoid or 
mitigate the loss of revenue or occurrence of cost. 

 
20.5.3. Non-Reserved Service 
 

Non-Reserved Service is electric energy and capacity the Company may supply during a 
scheduled outage of the customer’s on-site generation equipment during the service 
months of October through May.  Customers must request this service no less than 
twenty (20) days in advance of their anticipated need for this power and energy, stating in 
such request the amount of Non-Reserved Service demand (kW) to be scheduled and 
the expected period for which the service will be taken.  The Company, in its sole 
discretion, may approve or deny any request for Non-Reserved Service.  Arrangements 
for and scheduling of Non-Reserved Service will be agreed and confirmed in writing in 
advance of use.  The Company is not obligated to furnish Non-Reserved Service in 
excess of that which is scheduled by the customer.  Non-Reserved Service may be 
provided one time per calendar year for a period not to exceed thirty (30) days. 
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The Monthly Non-Reserved Service Billing Demand for each month during which Non-
Reserved Service is approved shall be the maximum measured 15-minute demand 
established during the Non-Reserved Service Period of such month less (1) in the case 
where a customer purchases power from the Company under other rate schedule(s), 
contract power as established under such other rate schedule(s) and (2) the scheduled 
Maintenance kW.  Non-Reserved Service Billing demand shall not be less than zero (0) 
nor shall it exceed the amount of demand that was requested and agreed.  Measurement 
of the customer’s maximum 15-minute demand is subject to relevant metering practices, 
power factor adjustments, and other provisions described herein. Usage and charges 
shall not be prorated.  Demand usage shall not establish demands for future minimum 
billing purposes of supplemental usage tariff application.  If the requested amount of Non-
Reserved Service results in the need for new or additional facilities and/or equipment, 
customer shall pay the net cost for installation and removal of such facilities. 

 
20.5.4. Backup Service 
 

Backup Service is the electric energy and capacity supplied by the Company during an 
unscheduled outage of the customer’s generating equipment and electric energy and 
capacity supplied by the Company during a scheduled outage that exceeds the sum of 
scheduled Maintenance Service and any scheduled Non-Reserved Service.  The 
customer is required to notify the Company of the time periods when Backup Service is 
being taken (the “Backup Period”) within 24 hours of the beginning and end of usage to 
avoid increasing the customer’s contract or ratcheted demand under other rate 
schedules. 
 
The Daily Backup Service Billing Demand for each calendar day during which Backup 
Service is taken shall be the customer’s maximum measured 15-minute demand during 
such day, less: (1) the sum of any scheduled kW of Maintenance Service and any 
scheduled Non-Reserved Service during such day and (2) in the case where the 
customer purchases power from the Company under other rate schedules, contract 
power as established under such other rate schedule(s). In no event shall the Daily 
Backup Service Billing Demand be less than zero. Measurement of the customer’s 
maximum 15-minute demand is subject to relevant metering practices, power factor 
adjustments, and other provisions described herein. 
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20.5.5. Energy Associated with Maintenance Service 
 

The energy associated with the Maintenance Service during a scheduled Maintenance 
Period shall be as metered by Company’s meters during the Maintenance Period less, for 
customers who purchase energy from the Company under other rate schedule(s), the 
energy used under such other rate schedule(s) in each hour of the Maintenance Period, 
measured as the average energy used under such other rate schedule(s) for the five 
hours prior to the beginning of the Maintenance Period. Maintenance Service energy in 
any hour may not exceed the scheduled Maintenance kW, and in no event shall the 
energy associated with the taking of Maintenance Service be less than zero. 

 
20.5.6. Energy Associated with Non-Reserved Service 
 

The energy associated with the Non-Reserved Service taken shall be as metered by 
Company’s meters during the Non-Reserved Service Period less, (1) for customers who 
purchase energy from the Company under other rate schedule(s), the energy used under 
such other rate schedule(s) in each hour of the Period, measured as the average energy 
used under such other rate schedule(s) for the five hours prior to the beginning of the 
Period, and (2) the energy associated with scheduled Maintenance Service. In no event 
shall the energy (kWh) in any given hour associated with the taking of Non-Reserved 
Service be less than zero nor greater than the requested and agreed level of demand 
(kW) of such service. 

 
20.5.7. Energy Associated with Backup Service 
 

The energy associated with Backup Service shall be as metered by Company’s meters 
during the Backup Period, less, (1) for customers who purchase energy from the 
Company under other rate schedule(s), the energy used under such other rate 
schedule(s) in each hour of the Maintenance Period or Backup Period, measured as the 
average energy used under such other rate schedule(s) for the five hours prior to the 
beginning of the Backup Period, and (2) the sum of any Maintenance Service energy and 
any Non-Reserved Service energy during each hour of the period.  In no event shall the 
energy associated with the taking of Backup Service be less than zero. 

 
20.5.8. Voltage Adjustment Rider (VAR) Applicability 
 

The metered Billing Determinants (kW and kWh) defined in this Section 20.5 and 
Demand Charges in Section 20.7 will be adjusted by Rate Schedule No. 18, Voltage 
Adjustment Rider (VAR), as applicable, before application of the Net Monthly Rate. 
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20.6. DAILY DEMAND 
 

The kW or kVA, if kVA metered, as shown by or computed from the readings of the 
Company’s demand meter, for the 15-minute period of greatest use during the day, 
subject to the following: 

1. If kVA metered: Billing kW = Metered kVA x 0.9 
2. If kW metered: Billing kW = Metered kW. 

 
20.7. NET MONTHLY RATE 
 
20.7.1. Customer Charge 
 
 Billing Item Rate 
 Charge per month: $468.60 
 

If a customer is taking electric service under another Company Rate Schedule, pursuant 
to § 20.4, the customer charge applicable to such other Rate Schedule will be zero. 

 
20.7.2. Reservation Charges 
 
 Billing Item Rate 
 Rate per kW of Reserved Service Billing Demand: $   3.73 
 
20.7.3. Maintenance Demand Charges 
 

For each calendar day the customer takes Maintenance Service within a billing month, 
the Maintenance Demand Rate to be applied to such day’s Daily Maintenance Service 
Billing Demand shall be the applicable daily demand rate shown below: 

 
 Billing Item Rate 
 Demand Charge:  
 Summer Period $/kW/Day: $   0.1748 
 Other Period $/kW/Day: $   0.1524 
 
The combined result for all days within the billing month is the Maintenance Demand Charge. 
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20.7.4. Backup Demand Charges 
 

For each calendar day the customer utilizes Backup Service within a billing month, the 
Backup Demand Rate to be applied to such day’s Daily Backup Service Billing Demand 
shall be the applicable daily demand rate shown below: 

 
 Billing Item Rate 
 Demand Charge:  
 Summer Period $/kW/Day: $0.4400 
 Other Period $/kW/Day: $0.3714 
 

The combined result for all days within the billing month is the Backup Demand Charge. 
 
20.7.5. Non-Reserved Service Demand Charges 
 

For each month during which the customer utilizes Non-Reserved Service, the Non-
Reserved Service Demand Rate to be applied to such month’s Non-Reserved Service 
Billing Demand shall be the rate for demand applicable under the customer’s rate 
schedule for supplemental service taken in conjunction with this Standby Service Rider.  
Should the customer take only Standby Service and no supplemental service rate 
schedule applies, the demand rate from the currently effective Large Power Service rate 
schedule shall apply to all Non-Reserved Service demand. 

 
20.7.6. Maintenance Energy Charges 
 

The Monthly Energy Rate to be applied to the energy associated with Maintenance 
Service as determined in § 20.5.5 shall be as follows: 

 
 Billing Item Rate 
 Energy Charge per kWh:  
 Summer Period: $0.02709 
 Other Period: $0.01927 
 

The result is the Maintenance Energy Charge. 
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20.7.7. Backup Energy Charges 
 

The Monthly Energy Rates to be applied to the energy associated with Backup Service 
as determined in § 20.5.6 shall be as follows: 

 
 Billing Item Rate 
 Energy Charge per kWh:  
 Summer Period: $0.02709 
 Other Period: $0.01927 
 

The result is the Backup Energy Charge. 
 
20.7.8. Non-Reserved Service Energy Charge 
 

The Monthly Energy Rate to be applied to the energy associated with Non-Reserved 
Service as determined in § 20.5.7 shall be the rate for energy applicable under the 
customer’s rate schedule for supplemental service taken in conjunction with this Standby 
Service Rider.  Should the customer take only Standby Service and no supplemental 
service rate schedule applies, the energy rate from the currently effective Large Power 
Service rate schedule shall apply to all Non-Reserved Service energy.  A monthly 
Avoided Cost adder shall also apply to all Non-Reserved Service energy.  This Adder 
shall be defined as the currently effective Rider SCR Avoided Cost Annual Average rate 
for the customer’s service voltage less the current Energy Cost Recovery Rider (ECR) 
factor.  

 
20.7.9. Minimum Charge 
 

The monthly Customer Charge plus the Reservation Charge shall represent the monthly 
minimum charge. Where the installation of excessive new facilities is required or where 
there are special conditions affecting the service, the Company may require in the 
contract a higher minimum charge and/or additional facilities charge arrangements to 
compensate for additional costs. 

 
20.7.10.Maximum Charge 
 

The monthly maximum charge shall be the sum of (1) the greater of (a) the Reservation 
Charge or (b) the sum of the Maintenance Demand Charge, the Backup Demand 
Charge, the Maintenance Energy Charge, and the Backup Energy Charge, for that month 
plus (2) the Customer Charge plus (3) the Energy Cost Recovery charge plus (4) the 
Non-Reserved Service Demand Charge plus (5) the Non-Reserved Service Energy 
Charge plus (6) any other applicable charges described in this tariff. 
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20.7.11.Adjustments 
 

Applicable Riders which adjust this Rate Schedule are listed in Rate Schedule No. 17, 
Table of Riders Applicable to Rate Schedules.  The Rate Adjustment for Large General 
Service Rate Class applications as defined by the currently effective ANO 
Decommissioning Cost Rider (NDCR), Rate Schedule No. 37, the currently effective 
Grand Gulf Rider (GGR), Rate Schedule No. 42, the currently effective MISO Rider, Rate 
Schedule No. 54, and the currently effective Capacity Cost Recovery Rider (CCR), Rate 
Schedule No. 47 shall be converted to daily rates for application to Daily Maintenance 
Service Billing Demands and Daily Backup Service Billing Demands in § 20.7.3 and § 
20.7.4 respectively by multiplying such Rates by a factor of 0.03288 and rounding to four 
(4) places. 

 
20.8. DEFINITION OF SUMMER PERIOD, OTHER PERIODS, AND ON-PEAK AND OFF-

PEAK HOURS 
 
20.8.1. Summer Period 
 

The Summer Period is defined as the billing months of June, July, August, and 
September. All other billing months are defined as “Other Period.” 

 
20.8.2. On-Peak Hours 
 

The Company’s On-Peak hours are: 
 

Summer Period: Other Periods: 
  
1:00 p.m. to 8:00 p.m. 7:00 a.m. to 6:00 p.m. 
Monday - Friday Monday - Friday 

 
20.8.3. Off-Peak Hours 
 

The Company’s Off-peak hours, for purposes of this schedule, are all hours of the year 
not specified as On-Peak hours. 
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20.9. OTHER PROVISIONS 
 
20.9.1. The customer shall pay to the Company the initial and continuing cost of any additional 

facilities including special metering facilities which are made necessary by 
interconnection with customer’s generating facilities. Continuing costs are considered to 
be the operation and maintenance, taxes and replacement costs, associated with any 
additional facilities. The monthly charge pursuant to this § 20.9.1, will be determined by 
multiplying the then current “Monthly % Post-Recovery Term” percentage found in § 26.4 
of Rate Schedule No. 26, Additional Facilities Charge Rider (AFCR) or § 53.4 of Rate 
Schedule No. 53, Additional Facilities Charge Rider – Governmental (AFCRG) if 
applicable, times the initial cost as modified to include costs associated subsequent 
capital modifications or additions to such facilities and in the case of replacement, the 
excess of the cost of replacement over the original installed cost of the replaced facilities. 

 
20.9.2. Protective Devices 
 

Unless provision is made for complete shutdown of customer’s electrical power 
production equipment and disconnection and/or isolation from other sources of power 
supply during periods when service is being taken from Company, customer will install 
and maintain at his own expense: 

 
A. Protective devices necessary for the protection of his personnel and equipment; 
B. Protective devices necessary in the Company’s judgment for the protection of 

Company’s personnel, equipment, and service. 
 
These protective devices are subject to inspection by the Company’s authorized 
representatives at all reasonable times. 

 
These protective devices shall include but are not limited to the following functions: 

 
A. To automatically disconnect customer facilities when Company’s service is 

interrupted;  
B. To prevent interconnection with Company’s system when Company’s supply line is 

de-energized;  
C. To protect equipment and personnel during synchronization and interconnection with 

Company’s system;  
D. To isolate and protect customer’s equipment when his generating equipment is not 

running. 
 

20.9.3. The customer shall hold harmless the Company from any loss due to damage or loss to 
customer’s equipment, personnel or property arising from or in connection with 
interconnection with Company’s system. The customer shall indemnify and keep 
indemnified the Company from and against all loss, damage and expense which the 
Company may sustain by reason of or in connection with the interconnection. 
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20.10. CONTRACT PERIOD 
 

The term of service shall be such as may be agreed upon in the contract, but not less 
than one year. 

 
20.11. PAYMENT 
 

The monthly bill shall be computed in accordance with § 20.7, Net Monthly Rate, other 
provisions of the rate schedule, and all applicable riders.  Payment shall be made in 
accordance with Rate Schedule No. 29, Charges Related to Customer Activity (CAC), § 
29.19.1. 

 


